
 



 

 

 

DATE: 4th – 8th December 

REPORT BY: Evi Dunphy 

WORK TYPE: SEO 

Welcome to your weekly update from Falcon Digital, this will include all actions taken by our 

talented SEO or digital marketing team to increase your search engine rankings or manage 

your social media.  

If you would like to discuss this further, please do not hesitate to contact us: 

Email: hello@falcondigital.co.uk 

Telephone: 01626 912 773 

We are extremely partial for a coffee and cake type of chat, so do not hesitate to pop in. 

As always, we are extremely grateful that you are working with us. 

Falcon Digital. 

Updates  
 
Working on 3XX redirect links  
  

  
  
 

Louise Jenner 
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Changed the following website links:  
•  https://louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/  
• https://louisejenner.com/about/ to https://www.louisejenner.com/about-job-
coaching/  
• https://louisejenner.com/privacy-policy/ to https://www.louisejenner.com/privacy-
policy/  

  

  
  
Fixed more website links on different modules:  
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/  

• Changed https://louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on desktop view  
• Changed https://louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on tablet view  
• Changed marka105.sg-host.com/coaching-programmes/  to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on mobile view in two places  

  
https://www.louisejenner.com/personal-development-coaching/  

• Changed https://louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on desktop view  
• Changed https://louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on tablet view  
• Changed marka105.sg-host.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on mobile view  

  
https://www.louisejenner.com/career-mentors/  

• Changed https://louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on desktop view  
• Changed https://louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on tablet view  
• Changed marka105.sg-host.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on mobile view  
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https://www.louisejenner.com/cv-writing-services/  
• Changed https://louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on desktop view  
• Changed https://louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on tablet view  
• Changed marka105.sg-host.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on mobile view  

  
https://www.louisejenner.com/business-coaching-for-women/  

• Changed https://louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on desktop view  
• Changed https://louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on tablet view  
• Changed marka105.sg-host.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on mobile view  

  
https://www.louisejenner.com/startup-coach/  

• Changed https://louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on desktop view  
• Changed https://louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on tablet view  
• Changed marka105.sg-host.com/coaching-programmes/ to 
https://www.louisejenner.com/coaching-programmes/ on coaching programmes button 
on mobile view  

  
  
 

Notes from your account manager: 

This week, we have been working on your 3XX errors, we have been making our way 
through all the pages which have redirect issues and uploading the accurate URLs. We have 
been fixing this on desktop, tablet and mobile versions. We will continue fixing your links 
next week.  
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18 Union Street, Newton Abbot 

Devon, TQ12 2JS 

 

01626 912773 


